






























































Person Info
Name:Theresa Burcher

Address Info
Street Address Email

Phone

Fax

CityArdmore
StatePA

Zipcode19003
Country82
CountyMontgomery

Survey Response Summary

Question Response Summary

Are you submitting a name change with this renewal? N

Have you completed your current CE requirements? Y

Do you hold, or have you ever held, a license, certificate, permit, registration or other 
authorization to practice any health-related profession in any state or jurisdiction?

Y

If you answered yes to the above question, please provide the profession and state or 
jurisdiction.

Delaware

Since your initial application or last renewal, whichever is later, have you had disciplinary action
taken against a professional or occupational license, certificate, permit, registration or other 
authorization to practice a profession or occupation issued to you in any state or jurisdiction or 
have you agreed to voluntary surrender in lieu of discipline?

N

Do you currently have any disciplinary charges pending against your professional or 
occupational license, certificate, permit or registration in any state or jurisdiction?

N

Since your initial application or last renewal, whichever is later, have you withdrawn an 
application for a professional or occupational license, certificate, permit or registration, had an 
application denied or refused, or for disciplinary reasons agreed not to apply or reapply for a 
professional or occupational license, certificate, permit or registration in any state or 
jurisdiction?

N

Since your initial application or last renewal, whichever is later, have you been convicted 
(found guilty, pled guilty or pled nolo contendere), received probation without verdict or 
accelerated rehabilitative disposition (ARD), as to any criminal charges, felony or 
misdemeanor, including any drug law violations? Note: You are not required to disclose any 
ARD or other criminal matter that has been expunged by order of a court.

N

Do you currently have any criminal charges pending and unresolved in any state or jurisdiction? N

Since your initial application or last renewal, whichever is later, have you had your DEA 
registration denied, revoked or restricted?

N

Since your initial application or your last renewal, whichever is later, have you had provider 
privileges denied, revoked, suspended or restricted by a Medical Assistance agency, 
Medicare, third party payor or another authority?

N

Since your initial application or your last renewal, whichever is later, have you ever had 
practice privileges denied, revoked, suspended, or restricted by a hospital or any health care 
facility?

N

Since your initial application or your last renewal, whichever is later, have you been charged by
a hospital, university, or research facility with violating research protocols, falsifying research, 
or engaging in other research misconduct?

N

Since your initial application or last renewal, whichever is later, have you engaged in the 
intemperate or habitual use or abuse of alcohol or narcotics, hallucinogenics or other drugs or 
substances that may impair judgment or coordination?

Since your initial application or your last renewal, whichever is later, have you been the subject 
of a civil malpractice lawsuit?

N

If yes, please submit a copy of the entire Civil Complaint, which must include the filing date and
the date you were served. PLEASE NOTE: If you previously reported the complaint to the 
Board you will only need to provide the docket number here:

 

Have you completed 2 hours of Board-approved continuing education in child abuse 
recognition and reporting?

Y

Do you maintain current medical professional liability insurance in the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania? 

Y

If you answer "No", please provide an explanation or reason for an exemption request.  
Please provide the zip code of your primary employer/practice location. This data is being 
collected for the purpose of identifying healthcare professionals during state emergencies and 
may be provided to the Pennsylvania Emergency Management Agency for official use only.
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Date Submitted:
Sunday, November 20, 
2016

 
Education Info

No education records

Employment Information

No employment records




























